
Top 60 Modern
Design Ideas for

Patio

Merge Patio With
Your Living Room
Blur indoor-outdoor boundaries
on covered patios using
coordinated furniture styles.
This creates a seamless
entertainment space with easy
access to indoor amenities.

Brick Floor Patio
Design
Define distinct spaces using
herringbone brick patterns as
"area rugs." Complement with
architectural features like water
elements, wooden gates, and
espalier plantings along walls.

Create a Private
Sunbathing Space 
Designate a sunny spot for
lounging with extension chairs
and teak furniture. Perfect for
both daytime sunbathing and
evening entertaining.

Use Modern Furniture 
Update traditional patio spaces
with contemporary pieces.
Choose clean lines and modern
materials over conventional
outdoor furniture for an
unexpected twist.
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After Dinner Patio
Design
Design your patio to support
natural flow between activities.
Create distinct zones that
transition smoothly from
poolside refreshments to BBQ
gatherings, ending with fireside
lounging.

Visit our website for more modern patio designs:
Luxemoderndecor.com 


